
BS-X01693-

6713023751
Page 1

Property Information Request Information Update Information

File#: BS-X01693-6713023751 Requested Date: 07/17/2024 Update Requested:

Owner: MONDACCI, VIOLET Branch: Requested By:

Address 1: 27 CARRIE DR Date Completed: Update Completed:

Address 2: # of Jurisdiction(s):

City, State Zip: HOWELL, NJ # of Parcel(s): 1

Notes

CODE VIOLATIONS Per Howell Township Department of Zoning there is an Code Violation cases on this property.

 

Collector: Howell Township 

Payable: 4567 Rt 9 North, 2nd Floor, Howell, NJ 07731-3382

Business# (732) 938-4500

Comments: Per Howell Township Department of Zoning there is an Code Violation cases on this property.

Please refer to the attached document for more information. 

 

PERMITS Per Howell Township Building Department there is an Open Permit on this property.

 

Permit # 20240039

Permit Type:REPLACEMENT GAS WATER HEATER

Collector: Howell Township 

Payable: 4567 Rt 9 North, 2nd Floor, Howell, NJ 07731-3382

Business# (732) 938-4500

SPECIAL ASSESSMENTS Per Howell Township Tax Collector Department there are no Special Assessments/liens on the property.

 

Collector: Howell Township 

Payable: 4567 Rt 9 North, 2nd Floor, Howell, NJ 07731-3382

Business# (732) 938-4500

DEMOLITION NO
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UTILITIES WATER

Account #: 

Payment Status: N/A

Status: Pvt & Lienable

Amount: N/A

Good Thru: N/A

Account Active: N/A

Collector: New Jersey American Water

Payable Address: 1 Water Street, Camden, NJ 08102

Business # 800-272-1325

UNABLE TO PROVIDE INFORMATION TO THIRD PARTIES. HOMEOWNERS AUTHORIZATION

REQUIRED.

SEWER

Account #: 2708004-0

Payment Status: PAID

Status: Pvt & Lienable

Amount: $0.00

Good Thru: N/A

Account Active: Active 

Collector: Howell Township

Payable Address: 4567 Route 9 North, 2nd Floor, Howell, NJ 07731

Business # (732) 938-4090

GARBAGE

GARBAGE PRIVATE HAULER WITH LIEN STATUS AND BALANCE UNKNOWN.



From: Xiomara Ortiz
Sent: Friday, August 16, 2024 8:58 AM
To: 'MLS@stellaipl.com' <MLS@stellaipl.com>
Cc: Diane Festino <dfestino@twp.howell.nj.us>; Allison Ciranni
<aciranni@twp.howell.nj.us>
Subject: FW: OPRA 24-1415-BLOCK 42.07 LOT 16

Good Morning,

Please see attached response submitted on July 30, 2024.

R egards,

X iomara Ortiz

Administrative Assistant III

Clerk’s Off ice

4567 R oute 9 N orth

2nd Floor

H owell, N J 07731

( 732)  938-4500 Ext. 2241

From: Xiomara Ortiz
Sent: Tuesday, July 30, 2024 3:01 PM
To: 'MLS@stellaipl.com' <MLS@stellaipl.com>
Subject: OPRA 24-1415-BLOCK 42.07 LOT 16

Good Afternoon,

Attached is the permit  history for property located at  27 Carrie Drive.

There is one open permit  - REPLACEMENT GAS WATER HEATER #20240039.

Taxes are current, there are no liens or special assessments for this property.
Please find open code enforcement violation

This completes your OPRA request.

R egards,

X iomara Ortiz

Administrative Assistant III

Clerk’s Off ice

4567 R oute 9 N orth

2nd Floor

H owell, N J 07731

( 732)  938-4500 Ext. 2241
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MEMORANDUM:

t.

TO: Charlie Muller, Engineering Inspector

IIOWELL TC~~V^'c

ENGINEE~"G Y3::~AFtT~,i:NT

DATE:_ -~ J~-?Jr~

ENGR:

ASST ENGR:

INSPECTOR:_ ~..~y

OTHER:
FROM: Vito Marinaccio, Director Land Use:

FII.E: ~ o? ~c~
DATE: June 22, 2000

RE: Developers Permit - Crosswoods Estates (COAH)
Block 42.07 Lot 16

The above mentioned developer has submitted the following Developers Permit:

BLOCK LOT ADDRESS

42.07 16 27 Carrie Drive

Please review and let me know if it meets with your approval.

RECEIVED

RETURNED ~/~ 
7 ~

SIGNATURE



I

1.

rn~~, undersigned hereby applies for a Developers Permit for the following to be issued on

the basis of the representations contained herein, all of which the applicant swears to be

tn:e.

1. LOCATION OF PROPERTX C ROSS wpG O F_.~T~r~S

BLOCK ~/ Z U7 LOT j,/o ~ / ~ D~

2. NAt~ OF LANDOWN-ERS: C Qf7S5 ~.+u~0 ~3Tid'fL~'S ..iNL

3. OCCUPAN"I': .. .

4. PROPOSED USE:

New Construction ~_ Residence
Remodeling Business

Accessory Bldg. Mf'g.

f Depth of lot from right-of--way ~') y

g. Dimznsions of bldg: ~s^.dth S >~ feet .~y depth(feet)

h. Highest point of bldg. Above reestablished grade 2 ~ feet

i. Area of lot J `~ Z ~

j. Sketch showing existing buildings and proposed construction

Buildings: Use ` ' ~ _

Number of stories Z Baseme N (~

Useable floor space: First Floor (~ 2. sq.ft Second Floor // O$

Off street parking space ~ sq. ft,

w h 1 t .-

isx~-+c+~~e..z~ t-F rs'rv--r.~-sr.+~, .»k''.,i<ti ~i3 +tt ~~~Tâ3~'t 6 . W'~ ~Y,..ai ~ 'w _ `;, 
t .. .

t - - £. !~..~ 
F i

JS ~+, 
w °~ x .' t',-, ~'

I
2;C*'fe~.7c Zr 1.`~ 

a. 
j, _ 

t
T ', _ /' ~ _ .

t .::. . ti t ! F „-?(c-~~c~`St'~ ,3y~c r: r ~ 

i C



RKS:

fitness: (SIGti-ED)

DATE ISSUED: l0 7~ Fee: /v.

Administrative Signature (~ uc~ue~

Complies with the provisions of the Howell Township Land Use Ordinance:

a) Review of other agencies:

b) Revisions made:

O Bonds posted:

d) Taxes and assessments are paid:

e) DOT approval, ifany:

f) Soil conservation, if any:

g) Monmouth County Planning Board:

h) Howell Township MUA

PERMIT APPROVAL GR?.i~1TED:

PER1vIIT APPROVAL DEiV)ED:

Upon the bans of the above . app cation;'tlie-.statemerifs are -made::part: hereof, .-the : ` = - -

proposed usage is-found to be in accordance-with the Township Land Use Ordinancz_z,~d ._. _-._. ~- . _

is.hereby approved .for the following .zone::. _....-.._.:.~:,~..;.~...: __,__..,:_ ______:_.__.-::.~.-- _ .._. _._:...... - - .

usage is

Ordinance and is hereby

found to be in accordance with the Township Land

appr ved for the following zone:

ADMINSTRA

DATE ~ VHE\T ~

PLI~ATIO\ 
WAS RECEIVED

ON: Co 7 ~

If certification is refused, reason for refusal

If certification is refused, reason for refusal:

IVE OFFICER

DATE RLZED
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Utility Account: 2708004-0

Block/Lot/Qual: 42.07 16.

Property Location: 27 CARRIE DRIVE

Service Location: 27 CARRIE DR

Owner Name/Address: MONDACCI, VIOLET

27 CARRIE DR

HOWELL NJ 07731-9072

 Sewer  

Make a Payment View Current Bill Project Interest Last Payment: 08/05/24

Current Charges:
Service Due Date Billed Balance Interest Total Due Status
Sewer 10/01/2024 159.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 PAID
Total 159.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Prior Paid Charges:
Service Due Date Billed Balance Interest Total Due Status
Sewer 07/01/2024 159.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 PAID
Sewer 04/01/2024 159.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 PAID
Sewer 01/01/2024 159.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 PAID
Total 477.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Charges Not Due Yet:
Service Due Date Billed Balance Interest Total Due Status
Sewer Not Due Yet 318.00 318.00 0.00 318.00 OPEN
Total 318.00 318.00 0.00 318.00

Return to Home

https://wipp.edmundsassoc.com/Wipp/?wippid=1321
https://wipp.edmundsassoc.com/Wipp/?wippid=1321
https://wipp.edmundsassoc.com/Wipp/?wippid=1321

