FW: Code/Permit/Special Assessment request - 382 S Daves St

From:

Sent:

To:

Subject: Fwd: Code/Permit/Special Assessment request - 382 S Daves St

Date:
Subject: Re: Code/Permit/Special Assessment request - 382 S Daves St

To: Kim Blue <KBlue@madisonvillegov.com>

On Thu, Jan 23, 2025 at 10:49 PM Kim Blue <KBlue@madisonvillegov.com> wrote:

There are no code enforcement cases or fines for the property at 382 S. Daves — Also the 2024 city taxes
have been paid. The amount paid was $35.99.

Please let me know if you need any additional information.

Thank You,

Kim Blue, MMC, KMMC

City Clerk, City of Madisonville
67 North Main Street
Madisonville, KY. 42431

Phone (270) 824-2101

Cell (270) 836-7482
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