MORTGAGE
CONNECT

Property Information Request Information Update Information
Filet: 23-2030559 Requested Date: 06/29/2023 Update Requested:
Owner: Becker Ronald S Becker Joy L Branch: Requested By:
Address1: 109 North 3rd St Date Completed: 07/06/2023 Update Completed:
Address 2: # of Jurisdiction(s): 1
City, State Zip: Denton, MD 21629 # of Parcel(9): 1
CODE VIOLATIONS Per Town of Denton Department of Zoning there are no Code Violation cases on this property.

Collector: Denton Planning & Zoning Department
Payable Address: 13 N 3rd St, Denton, MD 21629
Business# (410) 479-3625

PERMIT Per Town of Denton Department of Building there are no Open/Expired/Pending Permits
on this property.

Collector: Denton Planning & Zoning Department
Payable Address: 13 N 3rd St, Denton, MD 21629
Business# (410) 479-3625

SPECIAL ASSESSMENTS Per Town of Denton Finance Department there are no Special Assessments/liens

on the property.

Collector: Town of Denton Finance Department
Payable Address. Town of Denton 4 N. Second Street Denton, MD 21629
Businesst# 410-479-2050

DEMOLITION PERMIT No
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UTILITIES Water/Sewer:

Account #: 01-00565-00
Status: Active

Pvt & Non-Lienable: Lienable
Amount Due: $153.70.

Due Date: 07/30/2023

Account Active: Due
Payable to:Town of Denton.
Address: 4 N. Second Street Denton, MD 21629

PH: 410-479-2050

Trash:
Trash serviceis Bill along with TAX.
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05/07/2023, 15:51 SDAT: Real Property Data Search

Real Property Data Search ()
Search Result for CAROLINE COUNTY

View Map View GroundRent Redemption View GroundRent Registration

Special Tax Recapture: None
Account Identifier: District - 03 Account Number - 022315

Owner Information

Owner Name: BECKER RONALD S Use: RESIDENTIAL
BECKER JOY L Principal Residence: YES
Mailing Address: 109 N THIRD ST Deed Reference: /01278/ 00288

DENTON MD 21629-

Location & Structure Information

Premises Address: 109 N THIRD ST Legal Description: LOT 4830 SQFT
DENTON 21629- N 3RD ST
DENTON
Map: Grid: Parcel: Neighborhood: Subdivision: Section: Block: Lot: Assessment Year: Plat No:
0103 0009 0763 3010001.06 0000 2023 Plat Ref:

Town: DENTON

Primary Structure Built Above Grade Living Area Finished Basement Area Property Land Area County Use
2000 1,104 SF 4,830 SF

Stories Basement Type Exterior Quality Full/Half Bath Garage Last Notice of Major Improvements

1 NO STANDARD UNIT SIDING/ 3 1 full

Value Information

Base Value Value Phase-in Assessments
As of As of As of
01/01/2023 07/01/2022 07/01/2023
Land: 45,200 45,600
Improvements 97,100 127,900
Total: 142,300 173,500 142,300 152,700
Preferential Land: 0 0

Transfer Information

Seller: BECKER RONALD S Date: 10/04/2017 Price: $0
Type: NON-ARMS LENGTH OTHER Deed1: /01278/ 00288 Deed2:
Seller: SIMMS JOHN J Ill ETAL Date: 02/12/2014 Price: $97,000
Type: ARMS LENGTH IMPROVED Deed1: /01097/ 00306 Deed2:
Seller: SIMMS, JOHN J. Il Date: 08/12/2009 Price: $0
Type: NON-ARMS LENGTH OTHER Deed1: FDM /00874/ 00123 Deed2:

Exemption Information

Partial Exempt Assessments: Class 07/01/2022 07/01/2023
County: 000 0.00

State: 000 0.00

Municipal: 000 0.00]0.00 0.00]0.00

Special Tax Recapture: None
Homestead Application Information

Homestead Application Status: No Application

Homeowners' Tax Credit Application Information

Homeowners' Tax Credit Application Status: No Application Date:
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Fw: Final Meter Reading Request - 820 Calvert Towne Drive

Imtirangba Jamir <Imtirangba.Jamir@stellaripl.com>
Fri 07/07/2023 14:50

To:Praveen Immanvel <praveen.immanuel@stellaripl.com>

Sent: 07 July 2023 14:45

Subject: FW: Final Meter Reading Request - 820 Calvert Towne Drive

From: WS Billing <WSBilling@calvertcountymd.gov>
Sent: Friday, July 7, 2023 11:57 PM

Subject: RE: Final Meter Reading Request - 820 Calvert Towne Drive

Hi Praveen,
The current balance is $695.18. Payment is due by July 30, 2023.

Sincerely,

Charlene R. Jones

Account Technician

Enterprise Funds ¢ Department of Public Works
Community Resources Building ¢ 30 Duke Street
Prince Frederick, Maryland 20678

(410) 535-1600, x2211 Main Office

(410) 535-1600, x2298 Direct
Charlene.Jones@calvertcountymd.gov

about:blank 1/6
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Sent: Friday, July 7, 2023 2:13 PM
To: WS Billing <WSBilling@calvertcountymd.gov>

Subject: RE: Final Meter Reading Request - 820 Calvert Towne Drive

This Message Is From an External Sender

This message came from outside your organization.

Okay, could you please provide me what is the Current amount due at this time, and what would be the due date?

Regards,

Praveen Immanuel

Lien Search Department

Email- praveen.immanuel@stellaripl.com

5\

STELLAR INROVATIVE SOLUTIORS

From: WS Billing <WSBilling@calvertcountymd.gov>
Sent: Friday, July 7, 2023 2:11 PM

Subject: RE: Final Meter Reading Request - 820 Calvert Towne Drive

Hi Praveen,

We do not provide pay off information, I'm sorry!
Sincerely,

about:blank 2/6
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Charlene R. Jones

Account Technician

Enterprise Funds ¢ Department of Public Works
Community Resources Building ¢ 30 Duke Street
Prince Frederick, Maryland 20678

(410) 535-1600, x2211 Main Office

(410) 535-1600, x2298 Direct
Charlene.Jones@calvertcountymd.gov

From: Praveen Immanvel <praveen.immanuel@stellaripl.com>
Sent: Friday, July 7, 2023 2:08 PM

To: WS Billing <WSBilling@calvertcountymd.gov>

Cc: Prabhakaran R <Prabhakaran.R@stellaripl.com>

Subject: Final Meter Reading Request - 820 Calvert Towne Drive

This Message Is From an External Sender

This message came from outside your organization.

Please provide us Payoff Good Until 07/31/2023.

Regards,

Praveen Immanuel

Lien Search Department

Email- praveen.immanuel@stellaripl.com
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STELLAR INROVATIVE SOLUTIORS

From: WS Billing <WSBilling@calvertcountymd.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, July 5, 2023 4:36 PM

about:blank 3/6
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Subject: RE: Final Meter Reading Request - 820 Calvert Towne Drive

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know
the content is safe.

Good Afternoon,

Thank you for your request. Please note, however, that we are only able to provide a final invoice through the date of settlement. If the settlement date

will be July 15th, then this would be the date of our final read and final invoice. Please clarify whether you need a final read for July 15 or for July 31.
Once we receive this information, we will process your request.

Thanks for your assistance!
Sincerely,

Charlene R. Jones

Account Technician

Enterprise Funds ¢ Department of Public Works
Community Resources Building ¢ 30 Duke Street
Prince Frederick, Maryland 20678

(410) 535-1600, x2211 Main Office

(410) 535-1600, x2298 Direct
Charlene.Jones@calvertcountymd.gov

Sent: Wednesday, July 5, 2023 3:39 PM
To: WS Billing <Wsbilling@calvertcountymd.gov>

Subject: FW: Final Meter Reading Request Form

This Message Is From an Untrusted Sender

You have not previously corresponded with this sender.

about:blank 4/6
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Hello Team,

Please find attached the requested forms for the below request.

As this is a Rush request it will be a great help if we could have the information at the earliest.
Appreciate your help.

Regards,

Prabhakaran R
Email- Prabhakaran.R@stellaripl.com

\ STELLAR INNOVATIONS
THINK | INNOVATE | EXECUTE

From: WS Billing <WSBilling@calvertcountymd.gov>
Sent: 05 July 2023 14:45

Subject: Final Meter Reading Request Form

Some people who received this message don't often get email from wsbilling@gcalvertcountymd.gov. Learn why this is important

Good Afternoon James,

We have received your Public Information Request regarding the closing of a property in Calvert County.

Attached please find a Final Meter Reading Request Form to be completed when requesting a final read for a property which is going to settlement. There
is a five (5) working day notice requirement for this request, although it may be processed quicker. Once your form is completed, please submit via e-mail
to our office at WSBilling@calvertcountymd.gov for processing.

If you have e-mailed your completed form to us and your settlement date changes, please contact us at least three (3) working days prior, in order to avoid
an additional $35.00 fee for another meter read. We would also need to revise our invoice in order to have an accurate total, so the prior invoice we e-
mailed to you would be invalid.

If you have any questions, please feel free to e-mail or call our office.

Sincerely,

Charlene R. Jones
Account Technician

about:blank 5/6
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Enterprise Funds ¢ Department of Public Works
Community Resources Building ¢ 30 Duke Street
Prince Frederick, Maryland 20678

(410) 535-1600, x2211 Main Office

(410) 535-1600, x2298 Direct
Charlene.Jones@calvertcountymd.gov
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Your Request has been Updated: PIA - PZ - FY23 -Permit Records - 820 Calvert Towne Dr, Prince Frederick

Chrissy Nelson (County Administrator) <support@county-administrator.zendesk.com>
Thu 06/07/2023 13:28

To:MLS <mls@stellaripl.com>

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and
know the content is safe.

Hello Mls,

Thank you again for contacting Calvert County government. Your request #87036 has been updated. To respond or add additional information to your request,
please reply to this e-mail.

Planning & Zoning
Chrissy Nelson (Planning & Zoning)
Jul 6, 2023, 13:27 EDT

Thank you again for reaching out to the Calvert County Government with your request. At this time your inquiry has been satisfied and your ticket

is considered closed. Should you have any further questions, please feel free to reach back out.

Thank you,
Chrissy

Joe Hawxhurst (Planning & Zoning)
Jul 6, 2023, 10:30 EDT

There are no open, pending or expired permits for the property located at 820 Calvert Towne Drive in the County's permit tracking system which
dates back to December 1999.

Joe Hawxhurst

Inspections and Permits

Charlene Johnson (Planning & Zoning)
Jun 30, 2023, 15:48 EDT

Good afternoon,

There are no zoning code violations for the property located at 820 Calvert Towne Drive in Prince Frederick.
Thank you,

Charlene Johnson

Zoning Enforcement Specialist

Calvert County Planning and Zoning
410-535-1600 ext. 2571

Chrissy Nelson (Planning & Zoning)
Jun 30, 2023, 15:19 EDT

Mr. Falls,
Thank you for your PIA request regarding the property located at 820 Calvert Towne Drive.

Joe Hawxhurst, Division Chief with Inspections & Permits, will respond regarding any permit information on the property. Joe can be reached via

email at joe.hawxhurst@calvertcountymd.gov or by phone at 410-535-1600 x 2523.

Charlene Johnson, Code Enforcement Specialist, will respond regarding any zoning violations on the property. Charlene can be reached via email

at charlene.johnson@calvertcountymd.gov or by phone at 410-535-1600 x 2571.

County staff will respond within 10 business days.

Thank you,
Chrissy

about:blank 1/3
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